COLORADO COUNTY BIDS FOR ROAD PAVING
OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 3, 2025.
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2025 TO MARCH 31, 2026

Contractor: H & C Construction

Double Asphalting One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply MC-30 prime oil per gal. 5.85 5.85 5.85 5.85
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 per gal. 4.73 4.73 4.73 473
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10 per gal. 473 473 473 4.73
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 per gal. No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd. 01 01 01 01
Seal Coating One Two Three Four
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 asphalt per gal. 473 473 473 473
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10 473 473 473 4.73
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 asphalt per gal. No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd. .01 .01 .01 .01

Contractor: K-C Lease Service, Inc. DBA
Matagorda Construction & Materials

Double Asphalting One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply MC-30 prime oil per gal. 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 per gal. 5.40 5.40 5.40 5.40
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10 per gal. 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 per gal. 6.10 6.10 6.10 6.10
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd. 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00

Seal Coating One Two Three Four
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 asphalt per gal. 5.35 535 535 5.35
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10 5.40 5.40 540 5.40
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 asphalt per gal. 6.10 6.10 6.10 6.10
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd. 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00




